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Jefferson Street Sound 
Museum 

 
SHORT DESCRIPTION: 

Provide curated tours of the Jefferson Street 
Sound Museum to educate attendees of the 
music and entertainment legacies of historic 
Jefferson Street 1940-1970’s.  

 

LONG DESCRIPTION 

 

To provide tours to bridge the legacy with 
today’s global marketplace through artifacts, 
archives memorabilia and educational 
programs by supporting the research, 
preservation, and education of the history of 
Historic Jefferson Street. Curators Lorenzo 

EXHIBIT A
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Washington, Founder, Karen Coffee, Vice 
President. $40,000.00 

The Museum will provide a creative space to 
promote gifts and talents and artistic abilities 
by giving space in a historic, learning 
environment for artifacts, historic documents 
archive memorabilia to be available for public 
view. Individuals will be given the opportunity 
to develop skills that will develop maturity, 
build -self-esteem, and manage stress and 
self- sufficiency. Music education programs for 
adults and youth. 

 The Museum will provide networking and 
mentoring opportunities. Linking individuals 

(YOUTH and ADULTS) together by giving them 
the venue to express and advance  in their 
talent/gift with others that are on the same 
career or desired life plan they are on the 
pathway to achieve. $20,000.00 
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 The Museum will maintain collect, store and 
safely archive, capture stories, relevant 
artifacts, capture stories, ensure authenticity 
of products. This will help to reignite the music 
from back in the 1940-1970 period. $10,000.00 

 

The Museum will market the Jefferson Street 
Sound Museum through innovative strategies, 
that drive and elevate brand awareness, 
amplify social media presence and 
supercharge digital marketing efforts. The 
Museum will foster community connections 
and increase visibility among potential donors. 

 $10,000 

 


